CITY OF LAWRENCE
BID TABULATION
B1213_pump_motor rehab
UTILITIES DEPARTMENT
	
	Douglas Pump
	JCI
	Layne Christensen Co
	Lee Mathews
	Letts Van Kirk

	ITEM
	REBUILD ESTIMATE
	NEW UNIT PRICE
	REBUILD ESTIMATE
	NEW UNIT PRICE
	REBUILD ESTIMATE
	NEW UNIT PRICE
	REBUILD ESTIMATE
	NEW UNIT PRICE
	REBUILD ESTIMATE
	NEW UNIT PRICE

	1
	8,419.00
	9,657.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	5,350.00
	8,803.00

	2
	22,049.00
	103,040.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	20,803.50
	 
	13,416.00
	101,429.00

	3
	6,029.00
	8,093.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	5,152.00
	6,441.00
	7,545.00
	10,050.00

	4
	9,262.00
	50,570.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	14,115.61
	 
	6,507.00
	55,511.00

	5
	7,860.00
	9,807.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	6,514.00
	8,142.00
	8,145.00
	18,976.00

	6
	11,515.00
	16,897.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	16,422.00
	 
	12,351.00
	no bid

	7
	8,350.00
	no bid/obsolete
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	6,350.00
	no bid

	8
	8,330.00
	27,540.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	13,260.00
	 
	6,977.00
	35,429.00

	9
	5,988.00
	10,403.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	6,942.00
	8,677.00
	7,250.00
	no bid

	10
	11,727.00
	79,356.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	16,285.97
	 
	9,173.00
	103,550.00

	11
	10,322.00
	22,823.00
	 
	 
	12,333.00
	14,478.00
	 
	 
	no bid
	no bid

	12
	4,253.00
	no bid
	 
	 
	7,338.00
	6,633.00
	 
	 
	2,425.00
	no bid

	13
	10,322.00
	no bid
	 
	 
	12,333.00
	14,478.00
	 
	 
	no bid
	no bid

	14
	4,253.00
	no bid
	 
	 
	7,338.00
	6,633.00
	 
	 
	2,425.00
	6,667.00

	15
	7,860.00
	11,441.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	5,281.00
	6,601.00
	7,845.00
	9,754.00

	16
	16,509.00
	17,890.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	17,290.00
	 
	7,171.00
	21,143.00

	17
	12,775.00
	14,010.00
	6,325.00
	19,866.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	6,499.00
	16,160.00

	18
	9,604.00
	8,388.00
	5,325.00
	10,730.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	4,850.00
	8,209.00

	19
	12,865.00
	24,096.00
	7,995.00
	39,734.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	6,499.00
	29,825.00

	20
	12,419.00
	16,792.00
	6,325.00
	23,575.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	6,499.00
	19,923.00

	21
	25,997.00
	99,619.00
	13,560.00
	no bid
	 
	 
	 
	 
	11,989.00
	135,479.00

	22
	7,709.00
	8,901.00
	5,450.00
	11,960.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	4,850.00
	8,102.00

	23
	35,910.00
	78,143.00
	19,564.00
	56,890.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	16,153.00
	94,913.00

	24
	27,394.00
	46,829.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	15,132.00
	no bid

	25
	12,489.00
	25,494.00
	9,825.00
	no bid
	 
	 
	 
	 
	7,350.00
	30,436.00

	26
	19,555.00
	71,697.00
	20,368.00
	52,454.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	16,153.00
	91,672.00

	27
	32,603.00
	29,276.00
	19,209.00
	19,209.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	26,200.00
	34,320.00


	
	Douglas Pump
	JCI
	Layne Christensen Co
	Lee Mathews
	Letts Van Kirk

	ITEM
	REBUILD ESTIMATE
	NEW UNIT PRICE
	REBUILD ESTIMATE
	NEW UNIT PRICE
	REBUILD ESTIMATE
	NEW UNIT PRICE
	REBUILD ESTIMATE
	NEW UNIT PRICE
	REBUILD ESTIMATE
	NEW UNIT PRICE

	28
	5,700.00
	6,222.00
	3,276.00
	no bid
	 
	 
	 
	 
	3,650.00
	4,477.00

	29
	10,101.00
	27,684.00
	4,985.00
	14,306.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	no bid
	no bid

	30
	10,101.00
	27,684.00
	6,875.00
	24,465.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	no bid
	no bid

	31
	7,520.00
	45,270.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	7,253.00
	38,018.00

	32
	4,510.00
	3,560.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	3,030.00
	3,555.00

	33
	6,230.00
	no bid
	6,875.00
	11,960.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	6,707.00
	no bid

	34
	24,030.00
	no bid
	6,647.00
	no bid
	 
	 
	 
	 
	9,250.00
	44,265.00

	35
	21,680.00
	55,920.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	12,345.00
	47,022.00

	36
	24,030.00
	no bid
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	9,250.00
	44,265.00

	37
	14,027.00
	no bid
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	9,892.00
	33,729.00

	38
	12,954.00
	21,752.00
	3,502.00
	15,102.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	6,111.00
	no bid

	39
	12,464.00
	24,956.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	6,815.00
	20,332.00

	40
	4,620.00
	5,512.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	3,360.00
	6,339.00

	41
	4,460.00
	7,610.00
	2,148.00
	3,393.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	3,595.00
	7,489.00

	42
	5,740.00
	20,463.00
	19,979.00
	19,979.00
	 
	 
	 
	 
	20,100.00
	23,588.00

	43
	8,649.00
	no bid
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 


Yellow highlight is low bidder

